
DATE: 3 1 I ~ , ~ ~ A G E N D A  ITEM # 1 5  
( ) APPROVED ( ) DENIED 
( ) CONTINUED TO 

TO: JAMES L. APP, CITY W A G E R  

I - FROM: JOHN R. McCARTHY, DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS 

SUBJECT: AWARD OF BID FOR REPLACEMENT EQUIPMENT 

DATE: MARCH 16,1999 

Needs: For the City Council to award bids to purchase new equipment based on the City's Equipment Replacement 
Program. 

Facts: 1.  Based on the City's Equipment Replacement Program for fiscal year 1998-1999, bids were solicited 
for replacement equipment. 

2. . Bids were received on February 17,1999, for three pieces of equipment. 

3. Funding has been appropriated for the purchase of new equipment from the Vehicle Replacement 
Fund for General fund purchases. 

4. Bids on the Backhoe were reviewed and the following was determined: 
Pioneer Eauipment came in as the lowest bidder, but did not meet the specifications required for the 
curved Lower Boom. 
Coastline Equipment came in as the second lowest bidder and met the requirements. 
Ouinn Company - Met the requirements/specifications, but was the highest bidder. 

Analysis 
and 

-bl 
Conclusion: The following pieces of equipment will replace old stock that is eligible for replacement under the 

adopted Vehicle and Equipment Replacement Policy: 

LOW BIDDER: COASTLINE EQUIPMENT 

Xiheel Loa 

LOW BIDDER: CALIFORNLA TURF 

Equipment Type I Price 
Turf Sweeper 1 $14,664.78 

Policy 
Reference: Adopted Vehicle Replacement Program. 

Fiscal Impact: Funding in the amount of $95,094.78 for equipment replacement will come from the Vehicle 
Replacement Fund previously established by City Council. 

Options: A. For the City Council to adopt the attached resolution awarding equipment bids as set forth 
above, and authorizing the purchase of same. 



RESOLUTION NO. 99- 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF PAS0 ROBLES 

AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF REPLACEMENT 
EQUIPMENT 

WHEREAS, based on the City's Equipment Replacement Program for fiscal year 1998-1999, bids were 
solicited for replacement equipment; and 

WHEREAS, bids were received on February 17,1999, for replacement equipment; and 

WHEREAS, funding has been appropriated for the purchase of vehicles and equipment from the Vehicle 
Replacement Fund; and 

WHEREAS, total'Eost for this equipmem is.f95,094.78. . . '2 

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1. That the City Council of the City of Paso Robles does hereby authorizes the purchase of 
equipment totaling $95,094.78. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Paso Robles, this 16Lh day of March, 1999, on 
the following vote: 

AYES: 
NOES: 
ABSENT: 
ABSTAIN: 

Duane Picanco, Mayor 
ATTEST: 

Madelyn Paasch, City Clerk 



CITY OF PAS0 ROBLES 
BID SHEET 

BID SUMMARY SHEET FOR: Wipnent 

ITEM NAME FOR BID: Air Compressor 

DATE OF BID OPENING February 17, 1999 

TIME OF BID OPENING: 2:00 Pam* 

TOTAL WITHOUT 
OPTIONS 

VENDOR NAMEIADDRESS 

Coastline Equipment 

United Rentals 

Quinn Ccmpany 

Cal-Coast Machinery Inc. 

Hertz Equipnent Rental 

Olathe Manufacturing Inc. 

California Turf 

Evans & ! u i p ~ ~ t ,  I~c. 

Pioneer Equipnent Canpany 

Jensen & Pilegard 

OPTIONS(s) 
LISTED 

Used Compressor 
~11174.3 Hrs. 

TOTAL PRICE WITH 
SELECTED OPTIONS 

$13,937.14 

$14,468.03 

BID AMOUNT 
W/O TAX 

$12,995.00 

$ 6,600.00 

$13,490.00 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

SALES 
TAX 

942.14 

978.03 



CITY OF PAS0 ROBLES 
BID SHEET 

BID SUMMARY SHEET FOR: m i ~ t  

ITEM NAME FOR BID: Turf 

DATE OF BID OPENING February 1 7, 1 999 

TIME OF BID OPENING: 2:  00 P.m. 

TOTAL WITHOUT 
OPTIONS 

VENDOR NAMEIADDRESS 

California Turf 

Coastline mipnent 

United Rentals 

Quinn -Y 

Cal-Coast Machinery Inc. 

Hertz Equipment Rental 

Olathe Manufacturing Inc. 

Evans Equipnent, Inc. 

Pioneer Equipnent Canpany 

Jensen & Pilegard 

OPTIONS(s) 
LISTED 

TOTAL PRICE WITH 
SELECTED OPTIONS 

$14,664.78 

BID AMOUNT 
WIO TAX 

$13,610.00 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

SALES 
TAX 

$1 ,054.78 



CITY OF PAS0 ROBLES 
BID SHEET 

BID SUMMARY SHEET FOR: E q u i ~ t  DATE OF BID OPENING F e b m  1 7 ,  999 

ITEM NAME FOR BID: Wheel Imder Backhoe w/Extendible Boom TIME OF BID OPENING: 2 : 00 P.m. 

VENDOR NAMEIADDRESS 

Coastline Equipnent 

Pioneer Equipnent 

Quinn Cchnpan~ 

United Rentals 

SALES 
TAX 

4,494.86 

4,218.92 

BID AMOUNT 
WIO TAX 

$61 ,998.00 

$58,192.00 

$68,483.93 

$44,500.00 

Cal-Coast Machinery, Inc. 

TOTAL WITHOUT 
OPTIONS 

U s e d  Loader 

Hertz Equipnent Rental 

Olathe Manufacturing Inc. 

Evans Ekpipment, Inc. 

Jensen & Pilegard 

California Turf 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

NO BID RCV'D 

OPTIONS(s) 
LISTED 

TOTAL PRICE WITH 
SELECTED OPTIONS 

$66,492.86 

$62,410.92 

$68,483.93 

$44,500.00 




